
Biography Notes 
Coach Winn is America’s Mental Push-Up Coach! 

She is one of the nation’s foremost speakers on winning in life, love, and 
leadership sharing over 2,000 hours of WINNING WISDOM with audience 
members. Her clients include such diverse organizations as StubHub, 
Technicolor, Edward Jones, Volunteers of America, Grand Valley State 
University, and Stetson University Women’s Basketball Team. 

Coach Sherry Winn is a Two-Time Olympian, National Championship Coach, 
and Amazon Best Seller. She has written six books including, “Unleash the 
Winner Within You: A Success Game Plan for Business, Leadership, and 
Life.” 

In 2016 and 2017, she was voted as one of the top seminar trainers in the 
United States for her ability to combine entertainment, engagement, and 
empowerment. 

David Coleman, CEO of Coleman Productions said: “​When you hear Coach 
Winn speak, she is so compelling and passionate, it is like experiencing a 
verbal train wreck where you can't look away. You get exposed to one of the 
best coaches in America and walk away with thousands of dollars’ worth of 
wisdom and experience that propels you to championship status.” 

She is known as the storyteller extraordinaire, sharing stories which weave 
humor and insight. Your audience members will not just hear her stories; 
they will feel her stories so that when they depart your venue they are 90% 
more likely to take positive action. 

Coach Winn is the originator of the WIN Philosophy ™ and the WINNER 
Principles ™ and is known for her passion and belief system that ALL things 
are possible. 

Coach Winn has created a WINNING offer of her books and coaching 
packages for you today. They are available after her presentation where she 
will be honored to personalize the books for you. 

Fun Facts: 
As an athlete, Shery was a Two-Time Academic and Athletic All-American 
setting 11 school records including most points in a game (44) and highest 
career scoring average (21.7). She played in the 1984 and 1988 Olympic 



Games, The Pan American Games, The Goodwill Games, and the World 
Championships.  

Coach Winn led her teams to two Elite Eights and a National Championship. 
She was named National Coach of the Year in 1993 and Conference Coach of 
the Year five times. She has been inducted into the University of Charleston 
and MSU-Northern Hall of Fames for her excellence on the court. 


